4. AWARD OF CONTRACT
It is the intent of the District to award a contract(s) for each item in the Rate Schedule
Section either “per category,” “individually”, “in any combination”, or “as a whole,” to
any of the three lowest responsive and responsible bidder(s), pursuant to the authority
granted under California Public Contract Code Sections 20111 and 20118.1, to a single or
to multiple vendors, whichever is in the best interest of the District. Award is contingent
upon timely compliance with all bid conditions and specifications which must be satisfied

prior to award of contract.

5. BASIS OF AWARD

The award(s) shall be made to the responsive and responsible bidder(s) who submits the
Lowest Total Combined costs, either “individually”, “per category”, “as a whole” or “in
any combination”, whichever may be in the best interest of the District. All “rate of
discount offered” in the bid must be as District requested (i.c. case, each, package, etc.).
After contract award and for items under “rate of Discount”, the Contractor shall be held
to the “Percentage Rate of Discount” submitted from published price list for each specified
manufacturer.

The “percentage rate of discount offered” bid in the Rate Schedule Section (Section iii)
shall include any delivery charge to allow for delivery on an FOB Destination basis. The
District will verify all conversion and computations, if necessary.

The cash/trade discount shall be included in the determination of low bid. A cash discount
for a time period of less than 30 days may be considered. The cash discount offered in
excess of 10% will be considered a “trade discount”. A trade discount offered will be
deducted from the unit price(s) bid, thus establishing the items normal/actual contract cost
with zero percent cash discount for carly payment.

A Cash Discount of 0.00 % 45 Days is being offered.

Payment is contingent upon acceptance of the work and approval of invoice(s) by the
District Authorized Representative or designee.

The District, in an effort to become the Public agency of choice, has expanded upon its
ongoing Small Business Enterprise (SBE) program to further encourage and promote SBE
participation in District business opportunities.

In furtherance of the SBE community and program, efforts resulting in contract award(s)
stemming from this solicitation, any contract awardee(s) from this solicitation who are
certified Small Business Enterprises, will be entitled to a faster payment process. Contract
awardee(s) who have been certified by agencies such as the State of California’s
Department of General Services, the City of Los Angeles, Metropolitan Water District, or
by the Los Angeles Unified School District {must attach proof of certification at the time

Section II.A - Bid Form &
Rate Schedule Instruetions f IFR Na 2000007047



Section HJ
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder Mame: Pucific OneSource, Inc dba STS Education

Discounted Price  |Brand

1 Produect No. Extended Cost

! 99 |Pocumint Camera #1 I sI$s, 2112% 19593 Hoveram | HCSSH | 14447 07)
2 |300 Document Camera #2 N0 BID NO BID °c S NOBID | NOBID NO BID | HVALLE!
Note 1: Bidder 1o indicate percentage (° o) off catalog for other 19.41 %o (Percentage discount |

*Please mclude a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included i the Basis of Award
**Discounted wnit cost should include Section 11.C. 24. Required Services

CATEGORY 2; COLLABORATION DEVICE

Estimated Annuak
Ttem No, Quantity Item Mgrip;tii N List Price Percentage Discount Discounted Price |Brand Product No. __Extended Cost
i;‘_x' 99 1hora dpoint S0 BID NO BID % !‘j NO BID N0 BID +NO BID RVALLE!
SRR L4 A 8 il ) i + - - —_— .
b 99 car warranty with on |0 BRI (NO BID ®s |8 NOBID SO BID NO BID
il tirindicate percenta, lig tor inher
Note 1t hardware and sofiware not listed above? NO BID %o { Pereentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with vour hid. This will net be included in the Basis of Award

L **Discounted unit cost should include Section 11L.C. 4. Required Services

CATEGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR

(ltem No. {Mem Description Percentage Discount d Price  |Brand _1 Product No. _Extended Cost
Ha 199 \Callaboration Camera Bar us $3,944 o B75% [§ 256431 |Logilech |960-001308 ! 253866.69
|
4b 99 |Optional 3-year service plan 1 §999] 17.92% |§ 1 |994-000 168
Bidder to indicate percemage (%o} oif catalog for alher
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* 19.92  2q{Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Hasis ol Award
TTLyscounicd untt cost should include Section 114 . 24, Kequired Services

Estimated Annuat

Ttem No. Quantity Item Description LR |List Price _|Percentage Disc | Discounted Price  Brand | Extended Cost
\Sa 1000 |Plugable Dual Munitor Ducking Station Hub SNOBID NO BID %o '$ NO BID NO BID  NO BID
;3 1000 {ptional 2nd year manufacturer warranty |SNO BID [NOBID ®s |5 NOBID NO BID NORID |
Ridder to indicate percentage (%a) off catalog for ather
Note 1: hardware and software not [isted above® NO BID__ %o iPercemage discount)

*Please include a cop

f th vour tad This will not be i
**Liscounted unit cost s

huded in the Basis of Award

fton 11 €. 24. Required Se

STUDENT HEADSETS

:Estimted Annusl | | |
{ltem No. |Quantity Hem Description > List Price |Percentage Disconnt | Discounted Price  |Brand Product No. | Extended Cost
L | 100,000 i ] 3.5mm Stereo Headsets with Boom Mic| 1971 %0 | 183) AVID | AE-36 White | 1120000
Bidder 1o indicae percentage (% o) off catalog for other
Nee 12 hardware and software not Tisted above® 1971 %6 {Percentage discount}

*Please inciude a cops of the catal

**scoumed uni cost sk

» with your bid. This will nol be ncluded in the Basis of Anard

d include Section 11.C. 24, Required Senvices

CATEGORY 6: PROJECTORS

|
| Estimated Annual |

|

|ltem No. |Quantity _ |ltem Description ~ List Frice ‘!_Perrznlg_g_e Discount l Discounted Price  Brand Product No. Extended Cost

T HH — Il'.’-'luh' ¥ 51 Ili'l_ 49 K3 ¢ il 1:_ View S PGTOTW 1 5 473?!8?4_'

Ciptional Peerfess ceifing mount suspension plate and

b 400 exle culumn and or other District-approved manufagiurer | § “ % Peerless 3 0

| S 4 —— L ! - =Lt [ I | —— + :
|

o L0 | Prejecto SN0 BRID |NO BID . S NOBID | NOBID | NO BID ¥

v (800 e 40 BID [NOBID “ |3 NOBID NOBID | NOBID | §

[0 202 36ER



Section 111

Rate Schedule Section
— — — r

o 199 |Projector #4 el $5.009] 3368% I3 338154 ViewSanic ! LS920WL _I_s. h72926 46

( . 1o Projector 83 ‘ﬂiNO BID N0 BID % [ NOBID SO HID _1 N0 BID |5

12 10 Projector #6 SNOHID |NO BID % % NOBID | NOBD | NoBID /s |
Bidder (0 indicate percentage {%a) off catalog for other

Note I: hardware and software not listed abave® 12.37_ %o (Percentage discount}

*Pease include a copy of the catalog with your bad. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should include Section ILC. 24. Required Services

CATEGORY 7: INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARDS AND PROJECTION SCREENS

Estimated Annual |
Quantity Ttem Descripfion List Price P, ge Di Di 4 Price  |Brand ProductNo. | Extended Cost
— {1 escipi ——— . M| | - bt
3 +|f|0[| INTERAL I:\'l__tﬂ'-"’\lllii EDRY ERASER ROARD #1 7749 4:5 2 954,421 MuooreCo ‘ZGEKH{IG 95442_(2‘
14 o0 PROJECTION SCREEN #1 SNOHID |NoBmD o |s NomD NORID | NOBID i
|15 800 |PROJECTION SCREEN #2 [SNOBID NO BID “ § NOBID 1 NOHID | NO BID T
16 200 [PROJECTIO $%0 BID NOBID ‘% § NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
Badder 1o indr g for other
Note 1; hardware and softwarte not listed above® 7.74 %0 {Percentage discount)
TEICASC INCIuoe a_cl'f‘:- a1 e L.Jl.lli_l ilr.lgld 1 7S Wil B0 DR INCIUOEa 1N INE 133518 01T AWarg

**Discounted unit cost should include Scction [LC 24, Required Services |

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DISPLAY BOARDS

Estimated Annnal Extended Cost
Item No. Quantity Ttem Description - |
INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -INTERACTIVE
Lkd 18 [TOUCH BOARD #1 5 | % 8 | | 0|
L] 600 [ 35,0649 632% [$ APG-BHS-NA-D 1 1119354
—_— e R 5. -1 i3 S !
b . 600 | ) 0" $NO BID NOBID “e 4 NOBID NOBID  NOBID N
) 600 | 75 . §'.Fn9+ 6E96 % 1S ___234946] L AP 1 1408676
; J . % i | |
d (600 - 1 80" $NO BID N BID “a & NOBID NO BID _NOHID x |
i (600 B5" S10639 6983 % % 3209.68 Promethean APS-BEO-NA-T | 1 925808!
T -1 R —— T T OO WITIT T - TrwrTir Y T
£ LU wall mount IFP JINCLUDED WITHIFP 2 8 IFP Promethean | INCLUDED WITH IFP |
4 — cart/stand $709| 47.1 % |§ 375 Promethean | AP-FSM-TR 1 375000,
Bidder to indicatc percertage (% o) off catalog for other
Noie 1: hardware and sofiware not listed above* 1941 %o (Pereentage discount)
*Please ificlude a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
**[Hscounted w 1LC. 24, Reguired Senvaces

CATEGORY 9: AUDIO VIDEO MEDIA ACCESSORIES

Estimated Annual

Item Description = ) List Prii Percen i Brand | Product No.
18 2000 ] ATSC TV Converter Switch [N BID (N BID NO BID | NOBI}  NOBID 1 .
L] 2000 | 432 HDMI Matrix Switch SNOBID NOBID . S NOBID . NOBID __ NOBID 1 |
_:.'_U__ ‘IS{HI 1 !".-:I.qiﬁc_\i_ *A Svstem _S‘\tl BID __\HH][I 1% N0 BID 1 NO B[D_ § __NO BID 1 |
n 1500 id Dynamic Wireless Microphone System shomn 0 RID °, NO BID | NO BID NQ BID 8 |
n 100 FM Plus-Large-area Dual FM and Wi-Fi base transmitier  SNO BID [NOBID % NO BID NO BID T_g\:l BID |
13 |Sl.lll I'M Recever with seck-bution channe! selection \SNO BID O RID % NG RBID NG BID _'_'_NO BID ! i
4 500 Folding Headphe |5Nrslii[1 MO RID Ty NO BID | NO BID SO RID |
2 |100 B Large water-resistant Canry Case |SNO BID N0 BID °s NO BID NOBID NOBID
J26_ 200 1 _ Neckloop |SNOBID NG BID s S NOBID  NOBID  NOBID |
rl'-‘ 1500 | Mobile Sterage Can 1 $126.98 101.72% |8 — b by | 1 unor | ECAA-B 1 99990
|
Bidder (o indicate percentage (%o} off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and sofiware not iisted above® NO BID 94 { Percentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the catalog with yvour bid This will not be included in the Basis of Award
| **Discounted unit cost should include Section ILC. 24 Required Services —
Sechan LI b

Rate chednke: TR 20000673



Section 111
Rate Schedule Section

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE FRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (10A OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

G

AND DELIVERY FOR HY BRID COMPONENTS (HUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSIEAKERS, ETC.)

Quantity Item Description - l(‘_ril Per Unit
28 (99 [SECTION I- INTEGRATION SERVICES 378

*Please include a copy of the cmalog with vour bid. This will not be included in the Hisis of Award

ANEL DISPLAYS. E

[ GRATION SERVICES (e
I-INTEGRATION SERVICES |
i SERVICES

BID
pir eour ) 14

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This wilk not be included in the Basis of Award

S et [
Rize Subedu’s IEA 20002368




Section 111
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder Name: Pacific OneScurce, In¢ dba STS Edeeation

MOCUMENT CAMERA

[Estimated Anpual
Item No. uantity Item Description |Percentage Discount Die i Price |Brand _ Product No. | Extended Cost
L 99 |Doecument Camera #1 3 "u_|§ 1} 1
2 300 Docum s 1 % |8 |
Note 1: Bidder to indicale percertage (®e) off catalog for other %0 { Perceniage discount)
*Please nclude a copy ot the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

**Discounted unit cost should include Section [1C 24 Required Services

|Percentage Discount Discounted Price ) _Extended Cost
38 99 Collaboration Endpoint 3 | %0 |§ | |
3b 99 Optional 3-vear warrant ] %% |8 1 )i
Badder 1o indicate percentage |
Note 1: bardware and softaare not listed abine* %o {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

I **Discounted unit cost should include Section IL.C. 24. Required Services

CATEGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR

Estimated Anpual

_|ltem Description List Price

|ltem No. _|Quantity _ Extended Cost
|40 99 Collaboration Camera Bar 3 1 % |$ |
|4b Ll |Optional 3-vear servi s 1 | —_— 4
Bidder to indicate percemage {%a} ofT catalop for other
Note I3 hardware and software not listed above* %o (Percentage discount}

*Pleasc include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
Trihsgounied unil cost shoutd melude Seelron I 4. TV HCCS

[ '
Estimated Annual |

Ttem No. Quantity |Item Description . List Price Percentage Discount Di Price Brand | Product No. Extended Cost |
|5 Lo Plugable Dual Menitor Docking Station Hub jt] it Yo 8 |
\5b L Optional 2nd vear manuficturer warranty |$ | *u i§
Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
| Note 1: hardware and sofiware not listed ahove™® % (Perecntage discount)

*Please include a copy of al
**[hscounted umt cost S

included in the Basis of Award
s

CATEGORY UDENT HEADSETS

Estimated Anousf

|ltem No. Quantity |Item Description Product No. | Extended Cost
o 10, i 5. 5mm Stereo Headsets with Boom Mic|$ %o j_s 1 |
i I 1| <ITNTL G e 1 | e
Bidderto indicate percentage (24) of catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not lisied above* o { Percemage disconnt)

*Please include a copy of the
**Discounted umit cost should inc

: with your bid. This will ot be included in the Basis of Award
Section 11.C. 24, Required Services

|Estimated Ampual |
|Item No. ' Quantity Ttem Description |List Price |Percentage Di D d Price Product No. | Extended Cost
Ta 900 Projector # 51.994 326% |§ 1933 8% LG HE400S 1740452
| Ei B L A L 1 I — =B L } 1 |
! Optional Peerless ceiling mount suspension plate and |
lwmin and or other District-approved manufaciurer iS ]

7h | |extens
— A
I |
L il

!f’r-‘ Necto

s % s

o (800 Projecto

°
-

§
= . L

Rt Schedude 1FR ING0N2 168



Section 11

Rate Schedule Section
10 iC) [Projector 54 | 87% s LG | BFEOPST | 544877.92|
f - [Prujector #5 s | % 8 | |
12 10 s 1 w8 | |

T Bidder to indicate percentage (%) ofF catalog Tor other
Note 1 hardware and siftware not listed above® _ %o {Percentage discount)
*Ple: wlude 2 copy ot the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis ot Award

**Discounted unit cosi should include Section 11.C. 24. Required Services

CATEGORY T: INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY FRASER BOARDS AND PROMECTION SCREENS

Fstimated Annual
Tiemn No. Quantity Item Daseripth | ProductNo. |  Extended Cost |
s 1000 INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BCARD #1 3 + %0 8 = - - L

|
14 800 FPROJECTION SCREEN #1 5 | % 5 | 1
15 800 PROJECTION SCREEN #2 s 1% |
¢ - + ‘ —_—————- -+
16 200 PROJECTION SCREEN #3 It o &
Bidder Lo indicale percentage (®e) off catalog lor o ) i =
Noae 1: hardware and sofiware not listed above® 99 (Percentage discount )

THICASC INCIuGE 8 COPY OT TNE CAIAI0R WITH YOUT DI, [ NS WII ROT DE IRCILAZD 11 TNE BASIs O ARarG

: Section 11C. 24 Requir

**Discounied unit cost st

RY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL TOUCH DIS

Estimated Apaual

ProductNo. | Extended Cost

Ttem Description . |List Price Discounted Price _‘Ilrand = 1 |

[INTERACTIVE FLAT PANF]. DISPLAY -INTERACTIVE
ll" TOUCH BOARD #1 $ % 3 1
4 4 2o y: + 1 1 4 .
a B 65" 54354 6451 % iS 155581 Promethean -[AP'-]vAL’;S‘NA-I I 933546
e — J R i S — _— I s ¥iai i Sl ol . 2l
b 600 1 0°|8 l "o |8 | 1 )
'5' AL 57,1 W_‘ Tidi% IS 2039.78 Promethean | APO-ATENA-| 1 1223868

[ | i |
d (i) ! | o +5 B N
e 600 89.929 70754 |8 200K Pre | AP9-ARO-NA-1 1 740000
r 1 —— e r eI T T T T W T - T - 1
f 1000 wall mount | IFP JINCLUDED WITHIFP % 5 IFP | Promethean | INCLUDED WITH IFP |
1000 | cartéstand| $709, 4701% 8 375 Promethesn | AP-FSALIR | 375010
Bidder 1o indicale percentage (o) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* s {Pereentape discount)

*Pieasc include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be inchuded in the Basis of Award

**Discounted umt cost sh

Section ILC. 24, Reguired Services

CATEGORY 9: AUDIO VIDEO MEDIA ACCESSORIES

1

Discounted Price Product No, Extended Cost

it 2000 | AISC IV Conven $ ! % ls S
19 2000 1 452 HDMI Matrix Switch s 1 % i§
20 1500 Portable Mobile A System s 1 5 8 | |
2 1500 | UNE Cardioid Dynamic Wire 3 | % |8 | I
iil 1iHI M Plus-Larpe-arca Dual FM and Wi-Fi base transmitler Jt] B % [§ | ) i |
23 00 i Ftd Receiver with seek-bution channel selection 5 o 8 I 1 1 |
e S0 | Fulding Headphones s | o |8 - | !
{100 1 arge water-resistant Carm Case %0 8§ | 1
200 Neckloop $ % |$ L

i_:_'_ 1500 Mobite Storage {an 5 | ' |§

Bidder 10 indicate percentage (%o) off catalog for other

Note1: hardware and sofiware not listed above® __®o{Percernage discaunt)

*Please include a cops of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included i the Bast
|
B **Discounted unit cost should include Section 11.C. 24. Required Services o
Sezuan HI 4t

Rate Sebredele WD 2002368



Section 111
Rate Schedule Scetion

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (104 OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH
CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HYBRID COMPONENTS {HUR, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, ETC.)
|Estimated Annual |
Mem No. _|Quantity (Item Description o
SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES

|Cost Per Unit
3

*Piease include # copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in (he Basis of Award

AT PANEL DISPLAYS, ETC.)

I_!_Nh-\ 1000 a8 ES (per umit charge) $
|EUB (2000 | SERVICES (per hour 5 |
29C 1500 [TRAINING & 3 L 5 =
|_ *Please include a copy of the casalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
|
Seaton i 67
Rate Sehedule

1F8 I0MINC2I6E



Section 111
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder Name: Pacific OneSouree, In¢ dba STS Education

|Item Description — _|List Price _|Percentage Disconnt 4 i Price | Brand | Product No. Extended Cost |
1 Ji \Document Camera #1 - 5 i ] | | |
2 JEIL] Daocument Cam ) ! % |$ 1 1|
Note 1: Bidder 1o indicate pertentage (“ o} off cataleg for other % v (Percentage discount)
*Pleasc nclude a vopy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
** Discounted unit cost should include Section [1.C. 24, Requined Service
| Estimated Anuval
Iter No- [Quantity Tiem Description _ List Price F 1ge Discount | Discounted Price  [Brand Product No. Extended Cost |
3a 90 ) Yli‘nllahnr:uinn Endpaint L3 % § ! 1|
b 99 Optional 3 warranty with on % %o |8 | - | |
Hadder o indicate percemage
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® o (Percentage discount)
“Please include a copy of the cataloy with vour bid. This will rot be inciuded in the Basis of Award
L **Discounted unit cost should include Section [1.C. 24 Required Services

CATEGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR

Estimated Anaual |
[ltem N Quantity _|Item Description List Priee _|Percentage Discownt
Aa |99 |Collaboration Camera Bar - 1® -
4h 199 _|Oprional 3-year service plan |$ |
Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
Note 1! hardware and software not listed sbove®

*Ptease include a copy of th
**Liscounted il cosl sh

: catalog with vour bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
d mclude Seclion 1L 4. Requirad Services

[Estimated Annuoal

Discounted Price

Extended Cost

" {Percentage discount)

1tem No. Quantity Item Description Percentage Discount i Price  Brand I_ Product No. | Extended Cost |
N 1000 Plugable Dual Monitor Docking Station Hub s % |5
- A 4 Mg S { + § 1
Sh 1000 |Optional 2nd year manufacturer warranty 3 % | .
e e = - B
Bidder to indicate percentage {%) ofT catalog: for other
Nate 1: hardware and software not listed above* _ Ye{Percentage discount)

t he included in the Basis of Award

d Services

CATEGORY 5: STUDENT HEADSETS

|Estimated Annual

1 Price _Lllmnd | Product No. Extended Cost

Quantity |Ttem Description = List Price Di
i LLGIR G % |3
} s AL
Bidder to indicate percemtage (%) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above®

*Please include a copy of the catal

**Dhscounted umt cost should

2 with vour bl This will not be included in the Basis al Award
de Section I1.C. 24, Required Services

CATEGORY 6: PROJECTORS

%o {Percentape discount)

|

Estimated Apaual : |
\Mem No. Quantity ltem Description List Price J_ )
Ta 200 [Projector #1 ] |

! Peerless ceiling mount suspension plare and W

] 0 column and or other District-approved manufaciurer §
i 80D |Projes s |
a9 il Projector #3 it |
Sectan 111 s

R Scheduly

Extended Cost

FHH 20002348



Section [T

Rate Schedule Section
= — - )
L 199 |Peojector #4 5 l 1 1 | _i
L . L Projector #5 s |} 1 | l i
12 - 10 Projector #6 s | -
Tiidder to indicate percentage (°o) off catalog for other
Note 1z hardware and software not listed ahove* %9 (Percentage discount)
"Pleasc include a copy ot the catalog with your hid. This will noi be included n the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should include Section ITC 24, Reguired Services
Estimated Annual |
[{temn No. [Quantiry Xtem Descri; List Price Py ze [ Disconnted Price  |Brand ] Product No. Extended Cost
13 Ho INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARD#] | | "o % | 1
14 800 PROJECTHIN SCREEN #] § | % (% ! |
s 800 PRGIECTION SCREEN #2 +S I % 1% |
e 200 PRCJECTION SCREEN #3 1S 1 %o % 1
[ Bidder 1o indicale percer
Note 1: hardware and sotiwan: no i “o { Percentage chscount)

TFIEASE INCIUAE 3 Loy 0 1N N ¥iAF DIG, §TUS WIIE NOT DE INCILAGA 16 10E BA515 01 AWaIa

1LC. 24, Rey

**Discounted unit cost should incl ired Services

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE F

Estimated Annual
Quantity

Extended Cost

Item Drescription

INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -INTERACTIVF

17 TOUCH BOARD #1 "0 § | | I 0
T | ik |

8 600 $3.580 199 %% 1 Samsung WAGSC 704028

B= R L L3 ! 2

b Gl TS | ° § L

Ul 600 T0.E3 > WATSC 871536

= . 4 -

d (600 o Is | |

s - + i

3 600 - T84 % % Samsung | WARSC | 1147444

‘| 1000 wall mount| 'i'J'L Th43 " 3 ] i_-lﬂl-\_ll | :_‘.“.‘III

;g 1M can stand| $629] 48.77% |$ 322.22 BalanceBox 481A71001 | 322320

Bidder (o mdicate percentage (?4) off catalog for other

Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* “% { Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This wili not be included in thz Basis of Award

**Discounted unit cost should include Section 11C. 24 Reguired Services

Extended Cost

18 2000 AlSL nvener Switch % g
+ R e 4 - ! -
1 2000 | 4x2 HDMI Matna Switch ] 1 "o i§ 1
20 1500 | Portahle Mob Systen 5 1 0§ | | |
n 1500 aid Dynamic Wireless Microphone System 3 | % % N
2. 100 FM Plus-Large-area Dy M and Wi-Fi base transmifter _'1 | t
3 500 FM Receiver with seek-bution channel selection 3
; - = e — ! 4
4 S0 Folding Headphones H | |
| TELs 4 ORI 4 — — N -
25 100 Large water-resistam Carry Case 8 - |
200 | Maechloop 5 1 "e 8 1
|1500 Mobile ¢ s ; ! .
Bidder o indicaie percentage (o) off canalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not Jisted above* %o (Percentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will nat be included tn the Basis of Award
1 **Dhseounted unit cost should include Section 1LC. 24 Required Services -
St b

Ra St [EL BRI



Section 111
Rate Schedule Section

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY {10A OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND DELIVERY FOR HY BRID COMPONENTS (HUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, ETC.)

\tem No. Quantity \Ttem Description Cost Per Unit
128 99 (SECTION |- INTEGRATION SERVICES ] 18

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Avard

ATION SERV FOR NON-HY BRID COMPONENTS (INCLUDING PROJECTORS, DOCUMENT CAMERAS, INTERACTIVE TOUCH FLAT PANEL DISPLAYS, ETC.)

Estimated Annual

_ltem_]\'n_. QEnt 3 em Description

1294 1000 ISECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per unit ¢
2000 SECTION 1= INTEGRATION SERVICES (per hour charge) S
S ... A T SN MG A LA pe] 12
[1500 ~ [TRAINING SERVICES (per hour} -

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

Secton 1l I
Ft Sohedule

S 20000368



Section 111
Rate Schedule Seetion

Ridder Name: Pacific OneSource, Ing dba STS Education

ENT CAMERA

[Estimated Apnual

Quantity |llgm Descripti |List Price {Percentage Discount Price :_]!_rund Product No. Extended Caost
1 99 4L}t‘|.lll'lll'r|l Camera ¥1 It i | _1 |
2 300 Drscum 3 k] %2 |8
| |
Note 1: Bidder to indicate percentage (o) off catalog for other %o {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy o the catalog with your bid. This will not be included m the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should include Section I1.C. 24. Required Services

CATEGORY 2: COLLABORATION DEVICE

item No. Quantity Item Descripti |List Price [P ; Di Price _|Brand | ProductNo. |  Extended Cost_

3a 09 Collahy

4 i 1 S (" N— |

3b 99 = {Optional 3-vear wamanty with e repair replacer 5 % |§ | 1 1
Bidder 1o indicate pe catalog for oth
Node 1; hardware and sofiware not listad above* _ %b{Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis off Award

**Discounted unit cost should inclu

CATEGORY 3: COLLABORATION CAMERA BAR

Estimated Anoual

Item No. Quantity Disconnted Price _i_l?lg_s!_d Product No. Extended Cost |
[a BLC) |Collaboration Camera Bar s | | ——f | |
b 99 |Optional 3-year service plan 5 ) 1 |
Bidder 1o indicale percentage (%) off catalog for other |

Note Iz hardware and sofiware not listed above® ? o {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
**Luscounted umil Cost should nciude Section L. 24 Kequired Services

Estimated Anaual

Ifem No. |Quantity Price  Brand Product No. Extended Cost
Sa L Plugable Dual Monitor Docking Station Hub ] 9% +$
= L I\ T SOTANN ST OCk Mg o SR - S 1
|5 ALY Oiptional 2nd vear manufacturer warranty $ B ) | M|
Bidder io indicate percentage (%2} oft catalog for other
Nate I: hardware and sofiware ot fisted above* %a( Percentage discount)
*Please include & copy of the catalog wath your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
L **iscounted unil cost should mclude Section L 24, Heguired Services
Estimated Aatusl I
Item No. Quantity |ltem Description = |List Price F atage D Discounted Price | Brand | Product No. Extended Cost |
‘6 100,600 1 3.5mm Steren Headsets with Boom !\1|;i5 B 15 B |
Bidder to indicate percentage (%¢) off catalog for otier
Note 1; hardware and software not listed above™ %0 { Percentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
l +Discounted unit cost shoutd include Section 11.C. 24, Requzred Services

Estimated Annnal | |
:Ec_-m‘\n. _|Quantity Ttem Description = |List Price ) 2 | | Price | Brand | Product No. Extended Cost
Ts 900 Proy L3
r 4 == L i { il | S—
|
Uiptional Peerless ceiling mount suspension plate and
I'.'b o0 extension column and or other District-approved m, 1 =, 1 1|
| |
8 B (800 = |Projector #2 |5 | 1 |
9 |B0g Projector £3 ] .
sezvan 111 o

Ratg Shedule 1F D 2006368



Section 111

Rate Schedule Section
I T - ——r——
Ll 199 . Wector #4 iS il — | |
L 10 Projector &3 8
L b L) 4 +
12 1o |Proector #6 s | | | i

Bidder to indicate p Joft catalog for other

Note 1: hardware and software not listed above® %o (Pereentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the cataleg with your bid. This wili not be included in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unil cost should include Section 11U 24 Required Services

CATEGORY 7: INTERACTIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARDS AND PROJECTION SCREENS

Estimated Annual

|ltem No. Ttem Description = Product No. Extended Cost &
JLE IINTERACTIVE L OMPATIBLE DRY _I._H '\f‘-LRlS‘I.-‘«R]'_i:J 1\ 1 + | = = |
. so0 (PROJECTION SCREEN 41 s )i w s ‘
|
|'|ﬁ (RO PROJECTION SURFES 52 3 K 3

—_ R Nl i 1 . 31 e
|
L 200 ‘!'Ri MECTION SURER N3 “x ‘S 1 %% § 1 =4 b |

Badder t

MNote 1: hardware and software
“IIEdsE INCIUGE 3 Copy 0

“o (Percentage discounth
1N VUM D10, 1TIS W TIOL B INCILUOEY 111 UNE BAsis 0T AwEra

**Discounted unit cost sheuld mchide Section ILC. 24. Reguired Services

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIVE FLAT L TOUC AY BOARDS

Estimated Anneal
Quantity ltem Description

Extended Cost

Discounted Price | Brand

INTERACTIVF FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -INTERACTIVE

n 1 i TOUCH BOARD ‘\ 1 Yy ‘$ | | ! a

ia_c 60 1 657 $3.917 6518°% IS 135995 View Sonic IFP6550 + IFP-EW-60-02 815970,

b 6w o 70l - w5 | 1

0 6H 7 85,967 T0.92 s __s ViewSonc IFPTS50 « IFP-EW-T0-02 1041240
—— — e -

d 600 %2 &

’7 k — 4 == .8 L EEES 1 — Bk + 1 = 4

It‘ 600 . 85" $8.86T T7358% % 23425 ViewSonic TFP8650 + IFP-EW-80-02 1405500

I 1000 wall mount 109 5 5948 ViewSonic WhRA47.2 | 59480

I;z a 1000 canstand| _:i_"-"i‘ll 60.39% |§ 31647 ViewSonic | VB-STND-0I1 | 31

Bidder to indicate percentage (%a) oft catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and software not listed above* %o {Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

4 Nscou

ed unit cost should

Section HLC 24, Required Services

JRY 9: AUDIO VIDEO MEDIA ACCESSORIES

| Estimated Annual
(ltem No., | Quantity

Item Description Product No, J Extended Cost |

18 2000 ATSC TV Converter Switch
- 4 = HEAL Ll 8 4 |
19 2000 1 4x2 HDMI Matrix Switch ]
20 1500 | Portable Mobile PA System B 1 |
#1] 1500 e System 1
21 J]UE [FM Plus-Large-ares Dual P and Wi-Fi hase transmitter | 1
13 lﬁuu 1 I8 Receiver with seck-button channel selection ‘
24 1500 | Fulding Headphones ) 4l | |
15 100 Large water-resistant {am Case ! i - |
26 200 B | Nechloop 1
|27 1500 1 Mobile Storage Carl - 1 “
Bidder to indicate percentage (203 off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware ard sofiware not listed above® %o { Percentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost should include Section 11.C. 24, Required Services .
Secton (11 o

Rale Schedule IFR 1000002368




Section 11T
Rate Schedole Section

BIDDER MUST PROYVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (16A OR 10B} AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WARTHOUSING AND BELIVERY FOR HYBRID COMPONENTS (MUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, [TC.)

{Quantity 1tem Frescription {Cost Per Unit |
F 99 SECTION [- INTEGRATION SERVICES I3 |

*Please include a copr of the catatog with your bid. This will not be included in 1he Basis of Award

Cost
(SECTION 1- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per unit charge)  |%
_|2000 ISECTION I- INTEGRATION SERVICES (per hour charge; |$
1500 \TRATNING SERVICES (per flour} 5 m
L *Please include 1 copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
Swcnon il o

Rute Schedete [k B KK W



Section 111
Rate Schedule Section

Bidder Mame: Pacific OneSource, Inc dba STS Education

Note 1:

Note 1z

CATEGORY §; D

1000

*Please include a copy of the catalog with vour bid. This wiill not be included in the Basis of Award
**Discounted unit cost sheuld include Section ILC 24, Required Services

Estimated Annual

|
|
|Mem Description _ Discounted Price _‘Lllr-nd | Product No, Extended Cost |
i [
Decument Camera #1 S 1! I‘s 1 | 1
2z 1300 Document Camera 42 it | it - L |
|
Note 1: Bidder to ndicate percentage (®o) off catalog for other 2o (Percentage discount)
*Please include a capy of the catalog with your id. This will not be ncluded in the Basis ot Award
**Discounted unit cost should include Section 100 24 Reguired Services
- |
Estimsted Avnual |
Item No. Quantity Ttem Description |List Price P age [ i Price |Brand _Product No. |  Extended Cost
99 |Collaboration Endpoint 5 |8 , | i |
99 - (Optional 3-vear warranty with on-site repair replacement it 1 ] - 1 )
Badder 1o indicate percentage ("o off catalog
Note 1: hardware and sofrware nat listed above* % (Percentage discount)

Quantiry Item Description ___|List Price P Discount
04 Col on Camera Bar s
99 [Optional 3-year service plan |3

Bidder 1o indicate percentage (%} ofT catalog for other
hardware and software not listed abave*

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your brd. This will not be included in the Basis of Award
**LMSCOURLEd LM COSt SNOWI CIUAE Section §l4 24, Keguired Services

Product No. Extended Cost

%5 {Percentage discount)

Estimated Anoual
Qukutiey

Item Description

1000 cable Dual Monitor Discking Station Hub it]

(Optional 2nd year manufaciurer warranty 5
Bidder to indicate percentage (%) off catalog for other
hardware and soltware not listed above*

t be included in the Basis of Award
d herveces

ENT HEADSETS

Produnet Ne.

Extended Cost

"o {Percentage discount) |

Ttem

T List Price

‘ Note [z

" 100,000

3.5mm Steren Headsets with Boom Mic $ 1
Bidder to indicate percentage (%ol off catatog for other
hardware and software ot Fsted above*

*Please include a copy ol the

** Discour i

with vour hid. This wiil not be included in the Basis of Award
Sextion 11.C. 24 Required Senvices

Braod

Discounted Price Product No. Extended Cost

“a (Percentage discount)

Estimated Annual

|Quantity |Item Description |List Price |Percentage Discount
[To 900 I]'n-_ ctor 7] ]
!1 Iptiosil Peerless eeiling mount suspension plate and
Th Y00 [estension column and:or ather District-approved manutacturer
] (800 Projectar #2 |5 |
v 800 i5 |
Sacuan 11 F

Hate Swhedule

Product No.

Extended Cost

1E# 2002168




Section 11T

Rate Schedule Section
—
99 Yojector | ;
'm +I : }] rojector #4 ] - |
.! o Projector 45 s | | 1 { {
12 |10 |Projector 6 ) 5 | 1 | |
Badder o mdicate percentage (%o ) off catalog for ather
Noute 1: hardware and software not listed above* o o {Percentage discounty

*Please include a copy ot the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis ot Award
**Discounted unit cost should include Section 11.C. 74. Required Services

Y 7t INVERACTEIVE COMPATIBLE DRY ERASER BOARDS AND PROJECTION SCREENS

Estimated Annual
Ltem No. uantily Discounted Price Prodoct No. Extended Cost
|13 1000 INTERACTIVE COMPAT IBLE DRY ERASER BOARD #1 '3’5 ' b
14 500 APROJECTION SCREEN #1 s " 15 ifi L 1
'& ROD ‘PRI MECTION SCREEN #2 ‘S - | 9 i 1 1 |
ji6 200 |PROJECTION SCREEN #3 s % 3 | | |
Hidder 10 indscate perventage (o) off catalog for other
Note 1: hardware and sofiware not listed above* ___"atPercentage discount)

"FICASE IMILNE A CODY 01 1NE CALAI0E WILA ¥OUr Did. |15 Wik HOL D€ INCILOE 1N TNE BASIS 0T AWAra

*#Discounted unn cost should include Section 1€ 24 Required Services

CATEGORY 8: INTERACTIV

“H DISPLAY BOARDS

| Estimated Annual Extended Cost
bIlem Nl_l_. L Quantity Ttem D_d_:_si:riptiul - ——
INTERACTIVE FLAT PANEL DISPLAY -INTERACTIVE
17 TOUCH BOARD £1 I 1 fo [ 1 ! + 0.
o 600 | [ 25000 13270 % 5166826 LG | BSTR3DK-B |
b 600
v =
I} L) i3 5 T53TR3IDK-B 1242846
A { | .
d G0 % 8 l
= 3 + t —
3 Ly S-I..‘ﬁtl‘- 3539°% 8 52,7“16,0(’14 LG | 80TR3IDK-B _L 164 7hiN0
| e e -
f L) wall mo 556 ] {1} LG Wh-LOIS |
L — 1 | :
B LI |l cart stan 5438 5 LG ST-000F 37000
Bidder to indicate percentage (o) off catalog for otiier
Note 1: hardware and saftware nat listed above* ®5 (Percentage discount)

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

**Discounted umt cos should inc 1LC. 24 Required Services

CATEGORY %: AUDIO VIDEO MEDIA ACCESSORIES

Estimated Annual
= _Ig\_mnﬁiy i | i Discounted Price | Brand | Product No. L Extended Cost |

lm 2000 AlsC crter Switch %a & | |
e 4 e = 4 aL = A1 |
19 2000 42 HDMI Matrix Switch
20 1500 Porahle Mobile P4 System | 1
21 1500 I’HF Cardioid Dy namic Wireless Micruphone System
+ + { {
12 104 M Plus-Large-area Dual FM and Wi-Fi base transmiter —I| | “
23 S0 _FM Receiver with seek-burton channe] selection 3 ! 1 1
4 S 4 Folding Headphones |5
=5 § - e [ i i
25 100 1] Laree water-resistant Camy Case ] . A1 !
26 200 Neckloop s % 3 1
7 1500 N Mobile Storage Can s | % |§ . | ] |
Bidder 1o indicate percentage (% o) off catalog for ather
Note 1: hardware and sofiw arc not Fisted above* o {Percentage discount)
*Please include a copy of the catalog with your hid This will not be inchuded in the Basis of Award
L **Discoanted unit cost should include Section 11.C. 24 Reguired Services
Seatwn 1l on

Rater Sciedule IFD Z0min2368



Sectivn 11
Rate Schedule Section

BIDDER MUST PROVIDE PRICING ON A MINIMUM OF ONE INTEGRATION SERVICES CATEGORY (104 OR 10B) AND MAY PROVIDE PRICING ON BOTH

CATEGORY 10A: INTEGRATION SERVICES WITH WAREHOUSING AND
Estimated Annual

ELIVERY FOR HY BRID COMPONENTS (HUB, CAMERA BAR, EARSPEAKERS, ETC.)

( Item Description R |Cost Per Unit
18 99 (SECTION 1= INTEGRATION SERVICES s

*Please include a copy of the catalog with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

NON-HY BRID COMPONENTS (INCLUDING PROJECTORS, DOCUMENT CAMERAS

NTERACTIVE TOUCH FLAT PANEL DISPLAYS, ETC.)

Item Description )
INTEGRATION SERVICES (pe

EGRATION SERVICES (per hou
NG SERVICES (per howr)

*Please include a copy of the cataloy with your bid. This will not be included in the Basis of Award

Swawn LI I3
Rine Socheduly IFB 2002368




